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CHEMICALS FOR THE FOOD INDUSTRY 



Amtex is a company founded in 1965, the largest producer of
Sodium Carboxymethylcellulose (CMC), under the trade name
Gelycel, and functional polymers, a portfolio that complements
with other chemicals as resins for different industries. The
company is located in Medellin, Antioquia.

www.amtex-corp.com

AMTEX S.A

CMC: Sodium

carboxymethylcellulose.

Brand

Industrial

ISO 9001

Kosher certificate;

Halal certificate

FSSC 22000

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

5. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

6. CERTIFICATIONS

Large Company

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.amtex-corp.com/


Colorquímica S.A is a company founded in 1976, dedicated to

the production and commercialization of dyes, pigment
preparations, chemical auxiliaries, food additives and resins for
various sectors of the food and beverage industry. The
Company is located in La Estrella, Antioquia.

www.colorquimica.com.co

COLORQUÍMICA

Natural dyes.

Hydrosoluble colorants,

lacquers and their

specialties. Premixes of

vitamins and minerals.

Oleoresins and Essential

Oils. Sodium and sugar

substitutes

FSSC 22000, ISO 9001, ISO

14001, GMP, HACCP, BASC.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Large Company

3. PERFORMANCE

B2B; Distributors

2. CHANNEL

http://www.colorquimica.com.co/


CI REAL S.A.S is a company founded in 1994, dedicated to the
development, manufacture and marketing of additives and
ingredients for the food industry (human and animal). The

company is located in Cartagena, Bolivar.

www.realsa.co

C.I REAL S.A

Baking additives: glycerin,

baking powder, caramel

color. Food additives: sodium

citrate, caramel color,

distilled monoglyceride.

ISO 9001:2008

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Large Company

3. PERFORMANCE

Distributors and final

customer

2. CHANNEL

http://www.realsa.co/


Firmenich is a company founded in 1995, dedicated to the
development and manufacture of flavorings and aromas for
different types of industries such as food and cosmetics. The
company is located in Bogota, Cundinamarca.

www.firmenich.com

FIRMENICH S.A

Flavors: sweet, drinks, salty.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Large Company

3. PERFORMANCE

2. CHANNEL

Large companies in the

food and cosmetics

industry; intercompany CSR. ISO 14001.

http://www.firmenich.com/


Lucta Grancolombiana S.A.S is a spanish company founded in
1962, dedicated to the manufacture of fragrances, aromas and
additives for human and animal nutrition. The company is
located in Tocancipa, Cundinamarca.

www.lucta.com

Aromas (food, sweets,

salty). Fragrances

(Perfumery, air fresheners,

household cleanning,

clothing, Zootechnics.

(Additives, aromas,

essences.

Kosher. Halal- Halal Food

Council of Europe. DFE-

Designfor the Environment.

Green Seal.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Large Company

3. PERFORMANCE

2. CHANNEL

LUCTA GRANCOLOMBIANA 

S.A.S

Large companies in the

food industry;

intercompany.

Double click 
to start video

http://www.lucta.com/


Sucroal is a company founded in 1971, dedicated to the
manufacture and distribution of primary chemical products,
obtained from the transformation of sugar, through chemical
and biological processes. The company is located in Cali, Valle

del Cauca.

www.sucroal.com.co

SUCROAL

Non GMO: Citric acid;

Calcium Citrate; Sodium

Citrate; Potassium Citrate;

Zinc Citrate; Magnesium

Citrate.

ISO 9001, ISO 14001, OHSAS

18001, ISO 28000, BRC,

Kosher, Halal, GMP, Non

GMO.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Large Company

3. PERFORMANCE

Food industry companies.

B2B.

2. CHANNEL

http://www.sucroal.com.co/


Symrise Group is a company founded in 2005, global supplier of
fragrances, flavors, cosmetics, substances and functional
ingredients. The company is located in Bogota, Cundinamarca.

www.symrise.com

SYMRISE

Flavors: drinks, salt food,

sweet food.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Large Company

3. PERFORMANCE

2. CHANNEL

Manufacturers of perfumes,

cosmetics, food and the

pharmaceutical industry.

Producers of nutritional

supplements, pet food and

baby food.

PCHi Fountain Award at the
2017 Personal Care and
Homecare Ingredients

http://www.symrise.com/


Adiquim is a company with more than 20 years of experience,
dedicated to the development, production and marketing of
additives for human and animal consumption. The company is
located in Sabaneta, Antioquia.

www.adiquim.com

ADIQUIM S.A

Food additives

ISO 9001, HACCP, GMP,

BASC.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Constant Exporter

3. PERFORMANCE

B2B; Distributors

2. CHANNEL

http://www.adiquim.com/


Protecnica Ingenieria is a chemical oil company founded in

1978, that uses palm oil as a raw material to obtain inputs that
are used in the industries of cosmetics, pharmaceutical, sugar,
food, agrochemical, confectionery and plastic. The company is
located in Yumbo, Valle del Cauca.

www.protecnicaing.com

Food Ingredients:

defoamers, disinfectants

and descalers, emulsifiers,

other specialties.

Sugar and Fermentation:

Flocculants and

Coagulants. Bactericides

Fermentation. Chemical

specialties.

Constant Exporter

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

ISO 9001, BASC, ICA,

Orthodox Union.

PROTÉCNICA 

INGENIERIA S.A

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Distributors.

4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

2. CHANNEL

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.protecnicaing.com/


La Tour is a company founded in 1952, dedicated to the
manufacture of flavors, fragrances and natural extracts for the
food industry. The company is located in Cali, Valle del Cauca.

www.la-tour.com/

LA TOUR

Flavors (confectionery,

beverages, bakery, dairy and

snacks) natural extracts,

fragrances.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

Constant Exporter

3. PERFORMANCE

Production company

2. CHANNEL

http://www.la-tour.com/
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NUTRACEUTICALS



Procaps is a company with more than 40 years of experience,

dedicated to the development, manufacture and distribution of

pharmaceuticals, nutritional supplements, cosmetics and veterinary

products. It started its operations in the city of Barranquilla, as a pioneer

in the production of soft gelatin capsules, for which now is consolidated

as the largest softgel producer in Latin America with facilities in Brazil,

Colombia and Venezuela. The company is located in Barranquilla,

Atlantico.

www.procapslaboratorios.com

Omega 3. Vitamin E. Vitamin

C. Multivitamin. Bonfibra: a

fiber for slow bowel transit.

Brand and private label

Private sector: specialized

distributors, catalogue sales,

intercompany.

Public sector: public

purchases
GMP UE, FDA, ISO 9001, ISO

14000, BASC, Health Canada,

ANMAT, ANVISA

COFEPRIS, MOH, ICA, HALAL,

UAE.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Large Company

PROCAPS

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

5. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

6. CERTIFICATIONS

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.procapslaboratorios.com/


Laboratorios Funat is a company founded in 1995, dedicated to
the manufacture and distribution of natural products for
medicinal, cosmetic and nutritional use, based on active
elements extracted from medicinal plants and natural resources.
The company is located in Sabaneta, Antioquia.

www.funat.co

Phytotherapeutics
Brand and private label

B2B and distributors

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Constant Exporter

LABORATORIOS 

FUNAT

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

5. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.funat.co/


Naturmega is a company dedicated to the design, manufacture
and distribution of natural products for pharmaceutical and
nutritional use. The company is located in Barranquilla, Atlantico.

www.naturmega.com.co

Omega 3 Brand and private label

Distributors and large

pharmacies

ISO 9001, GMP, HACCP,

DG SANCO APPROVED,

BASC.

Constant Exporter

NATURMEGA S.A

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO 4. BUSINESS MODEL

5. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

6. CERTIFICATIONS

3. PERFORMANCE

2. CHANNEL

http://www.naturmega.com.co/


Protecnica Ingenieria is a chemical oil company founded in

1978, that uses palm oil as a raw material to obtain inputs that
are used in the industries of cosmetics, pharmaceutical, sugar,
food, agrochemical, confectionery and plastic. The company is
located in Yumbo, Valle del Cauca.

www.protecnicaing.com

Nutraceuticals

Constant Exporter

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

ISO 9001, BASC, ICA,

Orthodox Union.

PROTÉCNICA 

INGENIERIA S.A

5. CERTIFICATIONS

Distributors.

4. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

2. CHANNEL

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.protecnicaing.com/


Boydorr SAS is a company dedicated to the development of
specialized nutritional solutions for human consumption. The
company is located in Bogota, Cundinamarca.

www.boydorr.co

Nutritional food powder.
Brand

Distributors

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Ocassional Exporter

BOYDORR 

NUTRITION

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.boydorr.co/


Laboratorios Labfarve is a company with more than 30 years of
experience, dedicated to the manufacture of natural products
for cosmetics, made with extracts of flowers and plants. The
company is located in Bogota, Cundinamarca.

www.labfarve.com

Nutraceuticals and

phytotherapeutics
Brand and private label

Wholesale distributors and

online sales

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Ocassional Exporter

LABORATORIOS 

LABFARVE

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

5. CERTIFICATIONS 

3. PERFORMANCE

GMP

http://www.labfarve.com/


Laboratorios Natural Freshly is a company dedicated to the
manufacture of phytotherapeutics, dietary supplements and
veterinary products, made of extracts of flowers and plants. The
company is located in Bogota, Cundinamarca.

www.naturalfreshly.com

Nutraceuticals and

phytotherapeutics
Brand and private label

Wholesale distributors,

pharmaceuticals, sales

through calatogue

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Ocassional Exporter

LABORATORIOS 

NATURAL FRESHLY 

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

6. CERTIFICATIONS 3. PERFORMANCE

GMP

5. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

http://www.naturalfreshly.com/


Aral Products - Thel is a company with more than 28 years of
experience, dedicated to manufacturing nutraceutical products
and dietary supplements with herbal raw materials. The company is
located in Armenia, Quindio.

www.aralthel.com

Dietary supplements Brand

Distributors

Bureau Veritas, GMP, B

System, ISO 9001.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Ocassional Exporter

PRODUCTOS NATURALES 

ARAL – THEL 

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

6. CERTIFICATIONS

3. PERFORMANCE

5. MAIN EXPORT DESTINATIONS

http://www.aralthel.com/


Bionutrec is a company dedicated to the development and
manufacture of specialized formulas based on probiotics, for
human, agricultural and veterinary consumption The company
is located in Cali, Valle del Cauca.

www.bionutreccorp.com/

Probiotic-based

nutritional supplements
Brand

B2B and distributors.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Future Exporter

BIONUTREC

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.bionutreccorp.com/


Nutra & Foods is a company dedicated to develop

nutraceuticals for the pharmaceutical industry. The company is
located in the Free Trade Zone of Santander.

www.nutrandfoodsco.com

Nutradition: complete

powder and food balance.

Nutraum: Calico Nutragum

+ Vitamin D, Fiber

Nutragum, Nutragum

Vitamin C + Zinc

Brand and private label

B2B and distributors. ISO 9001

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Future Exporter

NUTRA & FOODS 

S.A.S

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

5. CERTIFICATIONS

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.nutrandfoodsco.com/


O’Celeste – Havva is company dedicated to the manufacture

of pharmaceutical products, medicinal chemical substances
and botanical products. The company is located in Cali, Valle
del Cauca.

www.havva.com.co/

Phytotherapeutics Brand

B2B, distributors, online

sales.

1. PRODUCT PORTFOLIO

Future Exporter

O’CELESTE

2. CHANNEL

4. BUSINESS MODEL

3. PERFORMANCE

http://www.havva.com.co/



